
WCPSS Recycling Bid Tabluation

Mixed Paper and Commingled Recycling Collection

Item # Service

Roll Cart 

Type 

No. of Roll 

Carts

No. of Pick 

Ups

(per week)

No. of 

Sites

Price per 

Pick Up, per 

Site

Total Cost 

per Week

Total Annual 

Cost

Price per 

Pick Up, per 

Site

Total Cost 

per Week

Total Annual 

Cost

1
Mixed Paper 

Collection
65 Gallon 1 to 5 1 76 $15.75 $1,197.00 $59,850.00 $15.76 $1,197.76 $59,888.00

2
Mixed Paper 

Collection
65 Gallon 6 to 10 1 24 $16.75 $402.00 $20,100.00 $25.07 $601.68 $30,084.00

3
Mixed Paper 

Collection
65 Gallon 11 or more 1 0 $17.75 $0.00 $0.00 $43.44 $0.00 $0.00

4
Mixed Paper 

Collection
95 Gallon 1 to 5 1 26 $16.15 $419.90 $20,995.00 $15.76 $409.76 $20,488.00

5
Mixed Paper 

Collection
95 Gallon 6 to 10 1 38 $17.15 $651.70 $32,585.00 $25.07 $952.66 $47,633.00

6
Mixed Paper 

Collection
95 Gallon 11 or more 1 1 $18.15 $18.15 $907.50 $43.44 $43.44 $2,172.00

7

Commingled 

Recyclables 

Collection
4

65 Gallon 1 to 5 1 1 $25.25 $25.25 $1,262.50 $15.76 $15.76 $788.00

8

Commingled 

Recyclables 

Collection
4

65 Gallon 6 to 10 1 15 $26.25 $393.75 $19,687.50 $25.07 $376.05 $18,802.50

9

Commingled 

Recyclables 

Collection
4

65 Gallon 11 or more 1 0 $27.25 $0.00 $0.00 $43.44 $0.00 $0.00

10

Commingled 

Recyclables 

Collection
4

95 Gallon 1 to 5 1 0 $25.70 $0.00 $0.00 $15.76 $0.00 $0.00

11

Commingled 

Recyclables 

Collection
4

95 Gallon 6 to 10 1 8 $26.70 $213.60 $10,680.00 $25.07 $200.56 $10,028.00

12

Commingled 

Recyclables 

Collection
4

95 Gallon 11 or more 1 1 $27.70 $27.70 $1,385.00 $43.44 $43.44 $2,172.00

190 Total: $3,349.05 $167,452.50 Total: $3,841.11 $192,055.50

Additional Roll Cart Pricing

Item # Roll Cart Type 

13 65 Gal

14 95 Gal

On-Demand Cart Cleaning

Item # Roll Cart Type 

$93.00 per 65 gal cart 

$98.00 per 95 gal cart

Price per Cart Cleaned

Price per Additional Roll Cart

$93.00

$98.00

Price per Additional Roll Cart

$75.00

$75.00

Price per Cart Cleaned

$35.00

SONOCO BID WASTE INDUSTRIES BID

Total: 

15

Note: Waste Industries unit price for Item 4 was bid as $25.07; however, their weekly and annual costs were calculated incorrectly. Correct weekly and annual costs are 

listed in the table above. The difference was was insignificant at only $3 for the weekly cost and $150 for the annual cost.

65 Gal and 

95 Gal
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WCPSS Recycling Bid Alternate Tabulation

Commingled Recycling Collection

Item # Service

Roll Cart 

Type 

No. of Roll 

Carts

No. of Pick 

Ups

(per week)

No. of 

Sites

Price per 

Pick Up, 

per Site

Total Cost 

per Week

Total 

Annual 

Cost

Price per 

Pick Up, 

per Site

Total Cost 

per Week

Total 

Annual 

Cost

16

Commingled 

Recyclables 

Collection

65 Gallon 1 to 5 1 1 $25.25 $25.25 $1,262.50 no bid no bid no bid

17

Commingled 

Recyclables 

Collection

65 Gallon 6 to 10 1 15 $26.25 $393.75 $19,687.50 no bid no bid no bid

18

Commingled 

Recyclables 

Collection

65 Gallon 11 or more 1 0 $27.25 $0.00 $0.00 no bid no bid no bid

19

Commingled 

Recyclables 

Collection

95 Gallon 1 to 5 1 0 $25.70 $0.00 $0.00 no bid no bid no bid

20

Commingled 

Recyclables 

Collection

95 Gallon 6 to 10 1 8 $26.70 $213.60 $10,680.00 no bid no bid no bid

21

Commingled 

Recyclables 

Collection

95 Gallon 11 or more 1 1 $27.70 $27.70 $1,385.00 no bid no bid no bid

25 Total: $660.30 $33,015.00 Total: no bid no bidTotal: 

SONOCO BID WASTE INDUSTRIES BID

NOTE: This bid alternate applies only to the first contract year (July 1, 2018 through June 30, 2019). Pricing is requested for collection of commingled 

recyclables in a manner such that weight estimates (separate from mixed paper) are generated and provided by the Contractor. If the alternate 

pricing is accepted, the bid prices for Items 16 through 21 will replace the bid prices for Items 1 through 6 for the first year only.
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