Oak City Multi-Services Center
BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGE NUMBER: 00A
BID PACKAGE DESCRIPTION: Temporary Toilets

Estimate Amount:

Bid Date: 2/28/2018
Bid Time: 10:00 AM

Bids Received:

Bidder #1

Bidder #3

Bidder #5 Bidder #6 Bidder #7 Bidder #8 Bidder #9 Bidder #10
- Sterling
CB&H Contracting KEA Bl.“ldmg Sparkle & Shine Construction
. Services .
Bidder Name Services
Base Bid Amount $ 54,000.00 60,800.00 | $ 62,740.00 76,700.00 $
Estimate $ 96,900.00 96,900.00 | $ 96,900.00 96,900.00
Variance $ (42,900.00) (36,100.00)( $ (34,160.00) (20,200.00)
Bid Alternates:
BC |BP-01A $ 3,000.00 7,300.00 | $ 3,600.00 6,700.00 $
Total Bid with Alternates $ 57,000.00 68,100.00 | $ 66,340.00 83,400.00 $
Bid Inclusion Items:
HUB Affidavits Provided (Yes / No) Y Y Y Y
Bid Bond Provided ( Yes / No) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Jeané Whittington Powers, Project Manager, Gilbane Building Company

| certify that the above is true and accurate tabulation of the bids opened at 10:00 AM on February 28, 2018




Oak City Multi-Services Center
BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGE NUMBER: 01B
BID PACKAGE DESCRIPTION: Final Cleaning

Estimate Amount:

Bid Date: 2/28/2018
Bid Time: 10:00 AM

4
Bids Received: Bidder #1 Bidder #3 Bidder #5 Bidder #6 Bidder #7 Bidder #8 Bidder #9 Bidder #10
. Dynamic Cleaning K&R Building .

Bidder Name CB&H Contracting Services Solutions Sparkle & Shine
Base Bid Amount $ 6,500.00 | 9,600.00 | $ 26,250.00 | $ 8,629.82 $ $
Estimate $ 8,876.00 | $ 8,876.00 | $ 8,876.00 | $ 8,876.00
Variance $ (2,376.00)| $ 72400 | $ 17,374.00 | $ (246.18)
Bid Alternates:

Total Bid with Alternates E 6,500.00 | § 9.600.00 | §  26,250.00 | § 8,629.82 | E E
Bid Inclusion Items:

HUB Affidavits Provided (Yes / No) Y Y Y Y
Bid Bond Provided ( Yes / No) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

| certify that the above is true and accurate tabulation of the bids opened at 10:00 AM on February 28, 2018

Jeané Whittington Powers, Project Manager, Gilbane Building Company




Oak City Multi-Services Center
BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGE NUMBER: 03A
BID PACKAGE DESCRIPTION: Concrete (Turnkey)

Estimate Amount:

Bid Date: 2/28/2018
Bid Time: 10:00 AM

Bids Received: Bidder #2 Bidder #3 Bidder #5 Bidder #6 Bidder #7 Bidder #8 Bidder #9 Bidder #10
Honducom s ior C t
Bidder Name Concrete uperior Concrete
Base Bid Amount $ 303,697.00 | ¢ 306,570.00
Estimate $ 162,192.00 [ $ 162,192.00
Variance $ 141,505.00 | $ 144,378.00
Bid Alternates:
19 |BP-03A-1 $ 10,034.00 | $ 8,230.00
$ 8,236.00 | $ 9,739.00
20 |[BP-03A-2
BC |BP-03A-3 $ 23,123.00 | $ (11,830.00)
Total Bid with Alternates $ 345,090.00 | $ 312,709.00
Bid Inclusion ltems:
Bid Supplement #1 Y Y
Bid Supplement #2 Y Y
Bid Supplement #3 Y Y
Bid Supplement #4 Y Y
HUB Affidavits Provided (Yes / No) Y Y
Bid Bond Provided ( Yes / No) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Certification By:

| certify that the above is true and accurate tabulation of the bids opened at 10:00 AM on February 28, 2018

Jeané Whittington Powers, Project Manager, Gilbane Building Company




Oak City Multi-Services Center
BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGE NUMBER: 04A
BID PACKAGE DESCRIPTION: Masonry (Turnkey)

Estimate Amount:

Bid Date: 3/14/2018
Bid Time: 10:00 AM

Bids Received: Bidder #1 Bidder #2 Bidder #3 Bidder #4 Bidder #5 Bidder #6 Bidder #7 Bidder #8 Bidder #9 Bidder #10
Bidder Name Boettcher Joy”\%;\f:mry RE-BID
Base Bid Amount $ 1,435,700.00 | $ 681,823.00 | ¢ $ $ $ $ $ $ $
Estimate $ 142,306.00 | $ 142,306.00
Variance $ 1,293,394.00 | $ 539,517.00
Bid Alternates:
BC |BP 04A-01 $ 113,100.00 | $ 167,924.00 | $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $
BP 04A-02 $ 51,600.00 | $ 48,740.00 | $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $
#N/A $ - $ - $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $
#N/A $ - $ - $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $
Total Bid with Alternates $ 1,600,400.00 | $ 898,487.00 | $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $
Bid Inclusion Items:
Bid Supplement #1 Y Y
Bid Supplement #2 Y Y
Bid Supplement #3 Y Y
Bid Supplement #4 Y Y
HUB Affidavits Provided (Yes / No) Y Y
Bid Bond Provided ( Yes / No) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Certification By:

| certify that the above is true and accurate tabulation of the bids opened at 10:00 AM on March 14, 2018

Jeane Whittington Powers, Project Manager, Gilbane Building Company




Oak City Multi-Services Center
BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGE NUMBER: 05A
BID PACKAGE DESCRIPTION: Structural Steel & Misc Metals

Estimate Amount:

Bid Date: 3/14/2018
Bid Time: 10:00 AM

Bids Received:

Bidder #1 Bidder #2 Bidder #3 Bidder #4 Bidder #5 Bidder #6 Bidder #7 Bidder #8 Bidder #9 Bidder #10
Bidder Name North State Steel SteelFab Struc(t)t;r:)lliitaeel of
Base Bid Amount $ 507,253.00 | $ 518,905.00 | ¢ 373,814.00 | § - 1 - |8 - 18 - 18 - 18 - 1% -
Estimate $ 284,314.00 | $ 284,314.00 | $ 284,314.00
Variance $ 222,939.00 | $ 234,591.00 | $ 89,500.00
Bid Alternates:
BC |BP 05A-01 $ 12,680.00 | $ 7,270.00 | $ 5,250.00 | $ - Is - s - s - |s - |s - |s -
BP 05A-02 $ 62,772.00 | $ 60,408.00 | $ 59,220.00 | $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ -
#N/A $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ -
#N/A $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ -
Total Bid with Alternates $ 582,705.00 | $ 586,583.00 | $ 438,284.00 | $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ -
Bid Inclusion Items:
Bid Supplement #1 Y Y
Bid Supplement #2 Y Y
Bid Supplement #3 Y Y
Bid Supplement #4 Y Y
HUB Affidavits Provided (Yes / No) Y Y
Bid Bond Provided ( Yes / No) N/A N/A

Certification By:

| certify that the above is true and accurate tabulation of the bids opened at 10:00 AM on March 14, 2018

Jeané Whittington Powers , Project Manager, Gilbane Building Company




Oak City Multi-Services Center
BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGE NUMBER: 06A
BID PACKAGE DESCRIPTION: Millwork

Estimate Amount:

Bid Date: 2/28/2018
Bid Time: 10:00 AM

Bids Received: Bidder #1 Bidder #2 Bidder #4 Bidder #5 Bidder #6 Bidder #7 Bidder #8 Bidder #9 Bidder #10
Bidder Name BAlasgziir;stZisp Cabinets by Design Xylem Inc RE-BID
Base Bid Amount $ 110,360.00 | $ 112,000.00 | $ 139,133.00 | $ $ $ $ $ $
Estimate $ 77,730.00 | $ 77,730.00 | $ 77,730.00
Variance $ 32,630.00 | $ 34,270.00 | $ 61,403.00
Bid Alternates:
BC [#N/A $ - $ - $ - $ $ $ $ $ $
#N/A $ - |$ - |$ - |$ $ $ $ $ $
#N/A $ - $ - $ - $ $ $ $ $ $
#N/A $ - |8 - |3 - |3 $ $ $ $ $
Total Bid with Alternates $ 110,360.00 | $ 112,000.00 | $ 139,133.00 | $ $ $ $ $ $
Bid Inclusion Items:
Bid Supplement #1 Y Y Y
Bid Supplement #2 Y Y Y
Bid Supplement #3 Y Y Y
Bid Supplement #4 Y Y Y
HUB Affidavits Provided (Yes / No) Y Y Y
Bid Bond Provided ( Yes / No) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

| certify that the above is true and accurate tabulation of the bids opened at 10:00 AM on February 28, 2018

Certification By:

Jeané Whittington Powers , Project Manager, Gilbane Building Company




Oak City Multi-Services Center
BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGE NUMBER: 07A
BID PACKAGE DESCRIPTION: Waterproofing and Joint Sealants

Estimate Amount:

Bid Date: 3/14/2018
Bid Time: 10:00 AM

Bids Received: Bidder #1 Bidder #4 Bidder #5 Bidder #6 Bidder #7 Bidder #8 Bidder #9 Bidder #10
J.T Murphy Triangle
Bidder Name Construction Waterproofing
Base Bid Amount $ 115,700.00 | ¢ 21,540.00 | $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ -
Estimate $ 30,697.00 | $ 30,697.00
Variance $ 85,003.00 | $ (9,157.00)
Bid Alternates:
BC [BP 07A-01 $ 3,490.00 | $ 1,800.00 | $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ -
#N/A $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ -
#N/A $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ -
#N/A $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ -
Total Bid with Alternates $ 119,190.00 | $ 23,340.00 | $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ -
Bid Inclusion ltems:
Bid Supplement #1 Y Y
Bid Supplement #2 Y Y
Bid Supplement #3 Y Y
Bid Supplement #4 Y Y
HUB Affidavits Provided (Yes / No) Y Y
Bid Bond Provided ( Yes / No) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Jeané Whittington Powers , Project Manager, Gilbane Building Company

| certify that the above is true and accurate tabulation of the bids opened at 10:00 AM on March 14, 2018




Oak City Multi-Services Center
BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGE NUMBER: 07B
BID PACKAGE DESCRIPTION: Roofing

Estimate Amount:

Bid Date: 2/28/2018
Bid Time: 10:00 AM

Bids Received: Bidder #1 Bidder #2 Bidder #3 Bidder #4 Bidder #5 Bidder #6 Bidder #7 Bidder #8 Bidder #9 Bidder #10
Bidder Name Baker Roofing | Curtis Construction Hamlin
Base Bid Amount $ 660,702.00 | $ 527,000.00 | § 678,749.00 $ - $ - s _
Estimate $ 657,590.00 | $ 657,590.00 | $ 657,590.00
Variance $ 3,112.00 | $ (130,590.00)| $ 21,159.00
Bid Alternates:
BC |#N/A $ -
#N/A $ -
#N/A $ -
Total Bid with Alternates $ 660,702.00 | $ 527,000.00 | $ 678,749.00 - $ - $ - - - - $ -
Bid Inclusion ltems:
Bid Supplement #1 Y Y Y
Bid Supplement #2 Y Y Y
Bid Supplement #3 Y Y Y
Bid Supplement #4 Y Y Y
HUB Affidavits Provided (Yes / No) Y Y Y
Bid Bond Provided ( Yes / No) N/A N/A N/A

| certify that the above is true and accurate tabulation of the bids opened at 10:00 AM on February 28, 2018

Certification By:

Jeané Whittington Powers, Project Manager, Gilbane Building Company




Oak City Multi-Services Center
BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGE NUMBER: 08A
BID PACKAGE DESCRIPTION: Doors Frames & Hardware

Estimate Amount:

Bid Date: 2/28/2018
Bid Time: 10:00 AM

Bidder #4

Bidder #5

Bidder #6

Bidder #7

Bidder #8

Bidder #9

Bidder #10

Bids Received: Bidder #1 Bidder #2 Bidder #3
Hardware Martin Architectural K&R Building
Bidder Name Distributors Products Solution
Base Bid Amount NO BID $ 104,453.00 | ¢ 286,300.00
Estimate $ 131,730.00 | $ 131,730.00
Variance $ (27,277.00)| $ 154,570.00
Bid Alternates:
1 [#NA $ -8 -8 )
2 [#NIA $ N N )
3 |#NA $ -l - |8 )
BC [#N/A $ - $ - $ -
Total Bid with Alternates NO BID $ 104,453.00 | $ 286,300.00
Bid Inclusion Items:
Bid Supplement #1 Y Y
Bid Supplement #2 Y Y
Bid Supplement #3 Y Y
Bid Supplement #4 Y Y
HUB Affidavits Provided (Yes / No) Y Y
Bid Bond Provided ( Yes / No) N/A N/A N/A

N/A

N/A N/A

N/A

N/A

N/A

N/A

| certify that the above is true and accurate tabulation of the bids opened at 10:00 AM on February 28, 2018

Certification By:

Jeané Whittington Powers, Project Manager, Gilbane Building Company




Oak City Multi-Services Center
BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGE NUMBER: 08B
BID PACKAGE DESCRIPTION: Exterior Doors & Windows, Glazing, Louvers

Bid Date: 3/14/2018
Bid Time: 10:00 AM

Estimate Amount: 1
Bids Received: Bidder #1 Bidder #2 Bidder #3 Bidder #4 Bidder #5 Bidder #6 Bidder #7 Bidder #8 Bidder #9 Bidder #10
Bidder Name S&S Glazing GlassTech RE-BID
Base Bid Amount $ 280,000.00 NO BID $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $
Estimate $ 141,659.00
Variance $ 138,341.00
Bid Alternates:
BC [#N/A $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $
#N/A $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $
#N/A $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $
#N/A $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $
Total Bid with Alternates $ 280,000.00 NO BID $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $
Bid Inclusion Items:
Bid Supplement #1 Y
Bid Supplement #2 Y
Bid Supplement #3 Y
Bid Supplement #4 Y
HUB Affidavits Provided (Yes / No) Y
Bid Bond Provided ( Yes / No) N/A

| certify that the above is true and accurate tabulation of the bids opened at 10:00 AM on March 14, 2018

Certification By:

Jeané Whittington Powers, Project Manager, Gilbane Building Company




Oak City Multi-Se

rvices Center

BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGE NUMBER: 09A
BID PACKAGE DESCRIPTION: Framing & Gypsum Assemblies

Estimate Amount:

Bid Date: 2/28/2018
Bid Time: 2:00 PM

Bids Received: Bidder #2 Bidder #3 Bidder #5 Bidder #6 Bidder #7 Bidder #8 Bidder #9 Bidder #10
Bidder Name Integrictzosuirvices Precision Walls | Sears Contract Inc RE-BID
Base Bid Amount $ 424,770.00 | $ 596,779.00 | $ 650,700.00 | $ - $ - $ - $ - $
Estimate $ 386,948.00 | $ 386,948.00 | $ 386,948.00
Variance $ 37,822.00 | $ 209,831.00 | $ 263,752.00
Bid Alternates:
BP 09A-01 $ 45,275.00 | $ 65,000.00 | $ 39,040.00 | $ - $ - $ - $ - $
BP 09A-02 $ (27,980.00)| $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $
#N/A $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $
#N/A $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $
Total Bid with Alternates $ 442,065.00 | $ 661,779.00 | $ 689,740.00 | $ - $ - $ - $ - $
Bid Inclusion Items:
Bid Supplement #1 Y Y Y
Bid Supplement #2 Y Y Y
Bid Supplement #3 Y Y Y
Bid Supplement #4 Y Y Y
HUB Affidavits Provided (Yes / No) Y Y Y
Bid Bond Provided ( Yes / No) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

| certify that the above is true and accurate tabulation of the bids opened at 02:00 PM on February 28, 2018

Certification By:

Jeané Whittington Powers, Project Manager, Gilbane Building Company




Oak City Multi-Services Center
BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGE NUMBER: 09B

BID PACKAGE DESCRIPTION: Acoustical Ceilings & Wall Panels

Estimate Amount:

Bid Date: 2/28/2018
Bid Time: 2:00 PM

Bids Received: Bidder #1 Bidder #2 Bidder #3 Bidder #4 Bidder #5 Bidder #6 Bidder #7 Bidder #8 Bidder #9 Bidder #10
Bidder Name Acousti Sorella Group Trigdemillss & Broézrsizg:ad RE-BID
Base Bid Amount $ $ - |3 - |s 49,030.00 | $ $ $ $ $ $
Estimate $ 63,138.00
Variance $ (14,108.00)
Bid Alternates:
BC [09B-01 $ $ - $ - $ 3,600.00 | $ $ $ $ $ $
#N/A $ $ - $ - $ - $ $ $ $ $ $
#N/A $ $ - $ - $ - $ $ $ $ $ $
#N/A $ $ - $ - $ - $ $ $ $ $ $
Total Bid with Alternates $ $ - $ - $ 52,630.00 | $ $ $ $ $ $
Bid Inclusion Items:
Bid Supplement #1
Bid Supplement #2
Bid Supplement #3
Bid Supplement #4
HUB Affidavits Provided (Yes / No)
Bid Bond Provided ( Yes / No) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

| certify that the above is true and accurate tabulation of the bids opened at 02:00 PM on February 28, 2018

Certification By:

Jeané Whittington Powers, Project Manager, Gilbane Building Company




Oak City Multi-Services Center
BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGE NUMBER: 09C Bid Date: 2/28/2018
BID PACKAGE DESCRIPTION: Ceramic Bid Time: 2:00 PM
Estimate Amount:
Bids Received: Bidder #1 Bidder #2 Bidder #3 Bidder #4 Bidder #5 Bidder #6 Bidder #9 Bidder #10
Bidder Name Bonitz Brock Carpet Queen Concordia David Allen Diamond Touch TileSetters
Base Bid Amount $ 64,850.00 | $ 52,700.00 | $ 82,237.00 | $ 46,600.00 | $ 69,040.00 | $ 54,895.00 | $ 49,550.00 | $
Estimate $ 62,355.00 | $ 62,355.00 | $ 62,355.00 | $ 62,355.00 | $ 62,355.00 | $ 62,355.00 | $ 62,355.00
Variance $ 2,495.00 | $ (9,655.00)| $ 19,882.00 | $ (15,755.00) $ 6,685.00 | $ (7,460.00)| $ (12,805.00)
Bid Alternates:
BC [#N/A $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $
#N/A $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $
#N/A $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $
#N/A $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $
Total Bid with Alternates $ 64,850.00 | $ 52,700.00 | $ 82,237.00 | $ 46,600.00 | $ 69,040.00 | $ 54,895.00 | $ 49,550.00 | $
Bid Inclusion Items:
Bid Supplement #1
Bid Supplement #2
Bid Supplement #3
Bid Supplement #4
HUB Affidavits Provided (Yes / No) Y Y Y Y Y Y Y
Bid Bond Provided ( Yes / No) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Certification By:

Jeané Whittington Powers, Project Manager, Gilbane Building Company

| certify that the above is true and accurate tabulation of the bids opened at 02:00 PM on February 28, 2018




Oak City Multi-Services Center
BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGE NUMBER: 09D

BID PACKAGE DESCRIPTION: Carpet, VCT, Synthetic Flooring

Estimate Amount:

Bid Date: 2/28/2018
Bid Time: 2:00 PM

Bids Received: Bidder #1 Bidder #2 Bidder #3 Bidder #4 Bidder #5 Bidder #6 Bidder #7 Bidder #8 Bidder #9 Bidder #10
Bidder Name Bonitz Brock Carpet Queen T'ig:iiz:_]osor
Base Bid Amount $ 84,047.00 | § 70,100.00 | ¢ 87,237.00 [ § 101,860.00 $ $
Estimate $ 58,887.00 | $ 58,887.00 | $ 58,887.00 | $ 58,887.00
Variance $ 25,160.00 | $ 11,213.00 | $ 28,350.00 | $ 42,973.00
Bid Alternates:
BC [#N/A $ - $ - $ - $ - $ $ $ $ $ $
#N/A $ - $ - $ - $ - $ $ $ $ $ $
#N/A $ - $ - $ - $ - $ $ $ $ $ $
#N/A $ - $ - $ - $ - $ $ $ $ $ $
Total Bid with Alternates $ 84,047.00 | $ 70,100.00 | $ 87,237.00 | $ 101,860.00 | $ $ $ $ $ $
Bid Inclusion Items:
Bid Supplement #1
Bid Supplement #2
Bid Supplement #3
Bid Supplement #4
HUB Affidavits Provided (Yes / No) Y Y Y Y
Bid Bond Provided ( Yes / No) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

| certify that the above is true and accurate tabulation of the bids opened at 02:00 PM on February 28, 2018

Certification By:

Jeané Whittington Powers, Project Manager, Gilbane Building Company




Oak City Multi-Services Center
BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGE NUMBER: 09E
BID PACKAGE DESCRIPTION: Painting

Bid Date: 2/28/2018
Bid Time: 2:00 PM

Estimate Amount: 6
Bids Received: Bidder #1 Bidder #2 Bidder #3 Bidder #4 Bidder #5 Bidder #6 Bidder #7 Bidder #8 Bidder #9 Bidder #10
Bidder Name Diamond Touch E. Caligari Hunter & Hunter | Integrity Services K&R Building Kenna Pro-Tec Tri-City
Base Bid Amount $ 55,685.00 NO BID NO BID $  124575.00 | $ 99,562.50 | $ 74,000.00 | § 78,400.00 | $ 51,250.00 | $ $
Estimate $ 129,898.00 | $ 129,898.00 | $ 129,898.00 | $ 129,898.00 | $ 129,898.00 | $ 129,898.00 | $ 129,898.00 | $ 129,898.00
Variance $ (74,213.00) #VALUE! #VALUE! $ (5,323.00)| $ (30,335.50)| $ (55,898.00)| $ (51,498.00)| $ (78,648.00)
Bid Alternates:
BC [#N/A $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ $
#N/A $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ $
#N/A $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ $
#N/A $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ $
Total Bid with Alternates $ 55,685.00 NO BID NO BID $ 124,575.00 | $ 99,562.50 | $ 74,000.00 | $ 78,400.00 | $ 51,250.00 | $ $
Bid Inclusion ltems:
Bid Supplement #1
Bid Supplement #2
Bid Supplement #3
Bid Supplement #4
HUB Affidavits Provided (Yes / No) Y Y Y Y Y Y
Bid Bond Provided ( Yes / No) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

| certify that the above is true and accurate tabulation of the bids opened at 02:00 PM on February 28, 2018

Certification By:

Jeané Whittington Powers, Project Manager, Gilbane Building Company




Oak City Multi-Services Center
BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGE NUMBER: 10A 10A 2/28/2018
BID PACKAGE DESCRIPTION: Toilet Partitions and Accessories Toilet Partitions and Accessories 2:00 PM
Estimate Amount:
Bids Received: Bidder #1 Bidder #2 Bidder #3 Bidder #4 Bidder #6 Bidder #7 Bidder #8 Bidder #9 Bidder #10
American Safety . . K&R Building . .
Bidder Name Products Classic Cleaning Solution LLC Martin Sterling
Base Bid Amount NO BID NO BID $ 61,392.82 | $ 55,000.00 | $ 68,500.00 | § $ $ $
Estimate $ 49,250.00 | $ 49,250.00 | $ 49,250.00
Variance $ 12,142.82 | $ 5,750.00 | $ 19,250.00
Bid Alternates:
BC [#N/A $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ $ $ $
#N/A $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ $ $ $
#N/A $ - |3 - |3 - |3 - |$ - |$ $ $ $
#N/A $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ $ $ $
Total Bid with Alternates NO BID NO BID $ 61,392.82 | $ 55,000.00 | $ 68,500.00 | $ $ $ $
Bid Inclusion ltems:
Bid Supplement #1
Bid Supplement #2
Bid Supplement #3
Bid Supplement #4
HUB Affidavits Provided (Yes / No) Y Y Y
Bid Bond Provided ( Yes / No) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Certification By:

Jeané Whittington Powers, Project Manager, Gilbane Building Company

| certify that the above is true and accurate tabulation of the bids opened at 02:00 PM on February 28, 2018




Oak City Multi-Services Center
BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGE NUMBER: 10B
BID PACKAGE DESCRIPTION: Signage

Estimate Amount:

Bid Date: 2/28/2018
Bid Time: 2:00 PM

Bids Received: Bidder #1 Bidder #3 Bidder #5 Bidder #6 Bidder #7 Bidder #8 Bidder #9 Bidder #10
Bidder Name AOA Signs Signature Signage
Base Bid Amount $ 15,840.00 | $ 2474100 | ¢ $ $ $ $ $
Estimate $ 13,750.00 | $ 13,750.00
Variance $ 2,090.00 | $ 10,991.00
Bid Alternates:
BC [#N/A $ - $ - $ $ $ $ $ $
#N/A $ - $ - $ $ $ $ $ $
#N/A $ - $ - $ $ $ $ $ $
#N/A $ - $ - $ $ $ $ $ $
Total Bid with Alternates $ 15,840.00 | $ 24,741.00 | $ $ $ $ $ $
Bid Inclusion Items:
Bid Supplement #1 Y Y
Bid Supplement #2 Y Y
Bid Supplement #3 Y Y
Bid Supplement #4 Y Y
HUB Affidavits Provided (Yes / No) Y Y
Bid Bond Provided ( Yes / No) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Jeané Whittington Powers, Project Manager, Gilbane Building Company




Oak City Multi-Services Center
BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGE NUMBER:

10C

BID PACKAGE DESCRIPTION: Operable Partitions

Estimate Amount:

Bid Date: 2/28/2018
Bid Time: 2:00 PM

Bids Received: Bidder #2 Bidder #3 Bidder #4 Bidder #5 Bidder #6 Bidder #7 Bidder #8 Bidder #9 Bidder #10
Bidder Name Maxson M. Michael Elkis Precision Walls Proven Products Sorella Group
Base Bid Amount $ 33,500.00 | $ 32,448.00 | $ 35,500.00 | $ 20,110.00 NO BID $ $ $
Estimate $ 31,350.00 | $ 31,350.00 | $ 31,350.00 | $ 31,350.00
Variance $ 2,150.00 | $ 1,098.00 | $ 4,150.00 | $ (11,240.00)
Bid Alternates:
BC |#N/A $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ $ $ $
#N/A $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ $ $ $
#N/A $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ $ $ $
$ - |$ - |$ - |$ - |$ - |$ $ $ $
Total Bid with Alternates $ 33,500.00 | $ 32,448.00 | $ 35,500.00 | $ 20,110.00 NO BID $ $ $ $
Bid Inclusion Items:
Bid Supplement #1
Bid Supplement #2
Bid Supplement #3
Bid Supplement #4
HUB Affidavits Provided (Yes / No) Y Y Y Y
Bid Bond Provided ( Yes / No) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

| certify that the above is true and accurate tabulation of the bids opened at 02:00 PM on February 28, 2018

Certification By:

Jeané Whittington Powers, Project Manager, Gilbane Building Company




Oak City Multi-Services Center
BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGE NUMBER: 12A
BID PACKAGE DESCRIPTION: Window Treatments

Estimate Amount:

Bid Date: 2/28/2018
Bid Time: 10:00 AM

Bids Received: Bidder #1 Bidder #2 Bidder #3 Bidder #4 Bidder #5 Bidder #6 Bidder #7 Bidder #8 Bidder #9 Bidder #10
Bidder Name Mid Altantic Sorella Group Contract Window RE-BID
Base Bid Amount $ - $ - $ - $ $ - $ $ $ $ $
Estimate
Variance
Bid Alternates:
BC [#N/A $ - $ - $ - $ $ - $ $ $ $ $
#N/A $ - $ - $ - $ $ - $ $ $ $ $
#N/A $ - $ - $ - $ $ - $ $ $ $ $
#N/A $ - $ - $ - $ $ - $ $ $ $ $
Total Bid with Alternates $ - $ - $ - $ $ - $ $ $ $ $
Bid Inclusion Items:
Bid Supplement #1
Bid Supplement #2
Bid Supplement #3
Bid Supplement #4
HUB Affidavits Provided (Yes / No)
Bid Bond Provided ( Yes / No) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

| certify that the above is true and accurate tabulation of the bids opened at 10:00 AM on February 28, 2018

Certification By:

Adam Fouse, Project Manager, Gilbane Building Company




Oak City Multi-Services Center
BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGE NUMBER: 22A
BID PACKAGE DESCRIPTION: Plumbing

Estimate Amount:

Bid Date: 2/28/2018
Bid Time: 10:00 AM

Bids Received: Bidder #1 Bidder #3 Bidder #4 Bidder #5 Bidder #6 Bidder #7 Bidder #8 Bidder #9 Bidder #10
Bidder Name ABL & Associates | spC Mechanical
Base Bid Amount $ 979,330.00 | $ 492,000.00 | - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ -
Estimate $ 270,859.00 | $ 270,859.00
Variance $ 708,471.00 | $ 221,141.00
Bid Alternates:
BC |BP 22A-01 $ 98,000.00 | $ 4,700.00 | $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ -
8 [#N/A $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ -
10 |#N/A $ - |8 - |8 - |3 - |3 - |3 - |8 - |8 - |8 -
#N/A $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ -
Total Bid with Alternates $ 1,077,330.00 | $ 496,700.00 | $ - |8 - |$ - |8 - |8 - |8 - |8 -
Bid Inclusion Items:
Bid Supplement #1 Y Y
Bid Supplement #2 Y Y
Bid Supplement #3 Y Y
Bid Supplement #4 Y Y
HUB Affidavits Provided (Yes / No) Y Y
Bid Bond Provided ( Yes / No) Y Y

Adam Fouse, Project Manager, Gilbane Building Company




Oak City Multi-Services Center
BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGE NUMBER: 23A
BID PACKAGE DESCRIPTION: Mechanical

Estimate Amount:

Bid Date: 2/28/2018
Bid Time: 10:00 AM

Bids Received: Bidder #2 Bidder #3 Bidder #4 Bidder #5 Bidder #6 Bidder #7 Bidder #8 Bidder #9 Bidder #10
Bidder Name Mechworks SPC l\éi(it;anlcal Watco
Base Bid Amount $ 1,298,000.00 | $ 1,231,000.00 | $  1,040,589.00 | $ - $ $ - $ - $ - $ -
Estimate $ 751,643.00 | $ 751,643.00 | $ 751,643.00
Variance
Bid Alternates:
sc lava $ - |8 - |8 - |8 - |8 $ - |8 - |8 - |8 -
#N/A $ - $ - $ - $ - $ $ - $ - $ - $ -
#N/A $ - |8 - |8 - |3 - |3 $ - |8 - |8 - |8 -
#N/A $ - $ - $ - $ - $ $ - $ - $ - $ -
Total Bid with Alternates $ 1,298,000.00 [ $ 1,231,000.00 | $ 1,040,589.00 | $ - |$ $ - |$ - |3 - |8 -
Bid Inclusion Items:
Bid Supplement #1 Y Y Y
Bid Supplement #2 Y Y Y
Bid Supplement #3 Y Y Y
Bid Supplement #4 Y Y Y
HUB Affidavits Provided (Yes / No) Y Y Y
Bid Bond Provided ( Yes / No) Y Y Y

| certify that the above is true and accurate tabulation of the bids opened at 10:00 AM on February 28, 2018

Certification By:

Jeané Whittington Powers, Project Manager, Gilbane Building Company




Oak City Multi-Services Center
BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGE NUMBER: 26A

BID PACKAGE DESCRIPTION: Electrical & Fire Alarm

Estimate Amount:

Bid Date: 2/28/2018
Bid Time: 10:00 AM

Bids Received: Bidder #1 Bidder #2 Bidder #3 Bidder #4 Bidder #5 Bidder #6 Bidder #7 Bidder #8 Bidder #9 Bidder #10
Bidder Name Harris Bros JC Electric Moonlite Pitt Electric
Base Bid Amount $ 702,456.00 | $ 568,500.00 | $ 555,000.00 NO BID - $ - $
Estimate $ 534,249.00 | $ 534,249.00 | $ 534,249.00
Variance $ 168,207.00 | $ 34,251.00 | $ 20,751.00
Bid Alternates:
4 [BP 26A-01 $ 191000 | $ -8 ) - - |8
Total Bid with Alternates $ 704,366.00 | $ 568,500.00 | $ 555,000.00 NO BID - $ - $
Bid Inclusion Items:
Bid Supplement #1 Y Y Y
Bid Supplement #2 Y Y Y
Bid Supplement #3 Y Y Y
Bid Supplement #4 Y Y Y
HUB Affidavits Provided (Yes / No) Y Y Y
Bid Bond Provided ( Yes / No) Y Y Y N/A
| certify that the above is true and accurate tabulation of the bids opened at 10:00 AM on February 28, 2018

Certification By:

Jeané Whittington Powers, Project Manager, Gilbane Building Company




Oak City Multi-Services Center
BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGE NUMBER: 27A
BID PACKAGE DESCRIPTION: Telecommunications

Estimate Amount:

Bid Date: 3/14/2018
Bid Time: 10:00 AM

Bids Received: Bidder #1 Bidder #2 Bidder #3 Bidder #4 Bidder #5 Bidder #6 Bidder #7 Bidder #8 Bidder #9 Bidder #10
A:.)’ ’ Caplt.al . Strategic
Communications, [ Communication ;
. Connections
Bidder Name Inc Service
Base Bid Amount $ 88,862.95 [ $ 40,712.39  $ 49,877.32 $ - $ - $ - $ - $ _ $
Estimate $ 55,015.00 | $ 55,015.00 | $ 55,015.00
Variance $ 33,847.95 | $ (14,302.61)| $ (5,137.68)
Bid Alternates:
4 $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $
6 [#NA $ - |8 - $ - |s - s - s s s
#N/A $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $
BC laniA $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $
Total Bid with Alternates $ 88,862.95 [ $ 40,712.39  $ 49,877.32 $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $
Bid Inclusion Items:
Bid Supplement #1 Y Y Y
Bid Supplement #2 Y Y Y
Bid Supplement #3 Y Y Y
Bid Supplement #4 Y Y Y
HUB Affidavits Provided (Yes / No) Y Y Y
Bid Bond Provided ( Yes / No) Y Y Y N/A

| certify that the above is true and accurate tabulation of the bids opened at 10:00 AM on March 14, 2018

Certification By:

Jeané Whittington Powers, Project Manager, Gilbane Building Company




Oak City Multi-Services Center
BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGE NUMBER: 31A
BID PACKAGE DESCRIPTION: Sitework (Turnkey)

Estimate Amount:

Bid Date: 2/28/2018
Bid Time: 10:00 AM

Bids Received: Bidder #1 Bidder #2 Bidder #3 Bidder #4 Bidder #5 Bidder #6 Bidder #7 Bidder #8 Bidder #9 Bidder #10
Faulconer FSClI LLC.dba Delta Development
. Construction Fred Smith of NC
Bidder Name Company
Base Bid Amount 1,499,845.00 | $ 1,144,000.00 | $  1,183,532.00 $
Estimate 838,982.00 | $ 838,982.00 | $ 838,982.00
Variance 660,863.00 | $ 305,018.00 | $ 344,550.00
Bid Alternates:
BC |BP 31A-01 68,035.00 | $ 40,000.00 | $ 78,310.00 $
Total Bid with Alternates 1,567,880.00 | $ 1,184,000.00 | $§ 1,261,842.00 $
Bid Inclusion Items:
Bid Supplement #1 Y Y Y
Bid Supplement #2 Y Y Y
Bid Supplement #3 Y Y Y
Bid Supplement #4 Y Y Y
HUB Affidavits Provided (Yes / No) Y Y Y
Bid Bond Provided ( Yes / No) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
| certify that the above is true and accurate tabulation of the bids opened at 10:00 AM on February 28, 2018

Certification By:

Jeané Whittington Powers, Project Manager, Gilbane Building Company




Oak City Multi-Services Center
BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGE NUMBER: 32A
BID PACKAGE DESCRIPTION: Landscaping

Estimate Amount:

Bid Date: 2/28/2018
Bid Time: 10:00 AM

Bids Received: Bidder #1 Bidder #2 Bidder #3 Bidder #4 Bidder #5 Bidder #6 Bidder #7 Bidder #8 Bidder #9 Bidder #10
Bidder Name Davis Lftr;dscape Ideal Landscaping Landartfglutions Southern Garden
Base Bid Amount $ 85,000.00 | $ 52,400.00 | $ 51,818.00 NO BID $ $ $ $ $ $
Estimate $ 80,100.00 | $ 80,100.00 | $ 80,100.00
Variance
Bid Alternates:
BC [BP 32A-01 $ 300.00 | $ 38,900.00 | $ 34,787.50 | $ - $ $ $ $ $ $
#N/A $ - $ - $ - $ - $ $ $ $ $ $
#N/A $ - $ - $ - $ - $ $ $ $ $ $
#N/A $ - $ - $ - $ - $ $ $ $ $ $
Total Bid with Alternates $ 85,300.00 | $ 91,300.00 | $ 86,605.50 NO BID $ $ $ $ $ $
Bid Inclusion Items:
Bid Supplement #1
Bid Supplement #2
Bid Supplement #3
Bid Supplement #4
HUB Affidavits Provided (Yes / No) Y Y Y
Bid Bond Provided ( Yes / No) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Certification By:

| certify that the above is true and accurate tabulation of the bids opened at 10:00 AM on February 28, 2018

Jeané Whittington Powers, Project Manager, Gilbane Building Company




Oak City Multi-Services Center
BID TABULATION

BID PACKAGE NUMBER: 32B
BID PACKAGE DESCRIPTION: Fencing & Gates

Estimate Amount:

Bid Date: 2/28/2018
Bid Time: 10:00 AM

Bids Received: Bidder #1 Bidder #2 Bidder #3 Bidder #4 Bidder #5 Bidder #6 Bidder #7 Bidder #8 Bidder #9 Bidder #10
Frye Fence .
Bidder Name Company Seegars Fence Sierra Structures
Base Bid Amount $ 61,500.00 | $ 47,688.00 [ $ 60,056.00 $
Estimate $ 53,328.00 | $ 53,328.00 | $ 53,328.00
Variance $ 8,172.00 | $ (5,640.00)| $ 6,728.00
Bid Alternates:
BC |BP 32B-01 $ 18,000.00 | $ 13,280.00 | $ 24,064.00 $
Total Bid with Alternates $ 79,500.00 | $ 60,968.00 | $ 84,120.00 $
Bid Inclusion Items:
Bid Supplement #1 Y Y Y
Bid Supplement #2 Y Y Y
Bid Supplement #3 Y Y Y
Bid Supplement #4 Y Y Y
HUB Affidavits Provided (Yes / No) Y Y Y
Bid Bond Provided ( Yes / No) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
| certify that the above is true and accurate tabulation of the bids opened at 10:00 AM on February 28, 2018

Certification By:

Jeané Whittington Powers, Project Manager, Gilbane Building Company




