Bids recieved

Apparent low

BPO1A General Trades Blddar
AAC Enterprises (CB&H Contracting | Sparkle and Shine |  TCS Cleaning Classic Cleaning K i;‘i?::;ng
CB&H Contracting
no bid $132,600.00 $152,999.98 no bid no bid $237,412.50

Base Bid:

Alternates:

NONE
Certification by: g éj{ 5

-
Jason Lovelace; Senior Project Manager, Balfour Beatty
Bids recieved Apparent low
Bidder
BPO1B Temporary Fence
i K & R Buildi
Careling Forwand Seegars Sierra Structures Frye Fence l_“ ik All State Fence |CB&H Contracting
Scaffold Solutions
Frye Fence
no bid no bid $45,283.00 $25,400.00 no bid no bid no bid

Base Bid:

Alternates:

NONE

wy

Certification by: ,%é/
/

lason Lovelace; Senior Project Manage%r Beatty




Bids recieved

Apparent low

BPO1C Final Cleaning By
AAC Enterprises |CB&H Contracting | Sparkle and Shine |  TCS Cleaning Classic Cleaning Janitors USA K&SR Bt.Jlldmg
ervices
JanitorsUSA
no bid s32,00000 [2343 1;:15 (pulled no bid no bid $28,774.00 $56,170.00
Base Bid; 1d)
Alternates:
$0.00 $0.00 50.00 $5,000.00
Alternate 04
$0.00 50.00 $0.00 $1,000.00
Alternate 04A
Certification by:
Jason Lovelace; Senior Project Manager, Balfour Beatty
Bids recieved Apparent low
5 e Bidder
SO Sitework / Utll.ItIES
& Asphalt Paving Faulconer
Construction Fred Smith Carolina Sunrock | Sullivan Eastern | Bridgepoint Civil MIS Pipeline
Company, nei Fred Smith
$2,192,000.00 $1,721,023.00 $2,236,928.00 $1,973,000.00 $1,875,680.00 no bid no bid
Base Bid:
Alternates:
$6,700.00 $25,000.00 $18,000.00 §7,000.00 $25,000.00
Alternate 04

bl

Certification by: 4
l_//

Jason Lovelace; Senior Project Manager, BMBeat‘tv




Bids recieved

Apparent low

BPO2D Site Concrete Bldder
Honducom Supericr Concrete . . .
Gontrets of NG, Inc. Martinez 1Q Contracting Briegan .
Martinez
Company
$167,242.00 $243,610.00 $131,600.00 no bid no bid
Base Bid:
Alternates:
$14,895.00 $7,155.00 $4,200.00
Alternate 05
Certification by: L
Jason Lovelace; Senior Project Manager, Balfour Beatty
Bids recieved Apparent low
i Bidder
SPOIG Norrs
Southern Garden, Cardinal 5 :
Davis Landscape | Ideal Landscape Landscaping BENEN-Sargey 4 |na. Bright View
- Inc. Landscaping
SIVITES Southern Garden
no bid $385,700.00 no bid $370,990.00 no bid no bid
Base Bid:
Alternates:
NONE

Certification by: Wﬁw—

Jason Lovelace; Senior Project Manager, Balfour Beatty




Bids recieved

Apparent low

BPO3A Deep Foundations Bldder
American Deep HJ Foundation Berkel Long Hayward Baker
Berkel
$510,000.00 no bid $496,000.00 no bid no bid

Base Bid:

Alternates:

NONE
Certification by: M%__\
lason Lovelace; Senior Project Manager, Balfour Beatty

Bids recieved Apparent low
Bidder
BPO3B Concrete
Central Concrete G Contracting Superior Concrete Honducom Wi Briegan
of NC of NC, Inc. Concrete .
Martinez
Company
No bid $1,490,200.00 $1,859,380.00 $1,450,327.00 $1,176,250.00 No bid
Base Bid:
Alternates:
$117,940.00 $92,180.00 $31,301.00 $18,160.00
Alternate 04
$39,850.00 $40,520.00 $3,213.00 $3,000.00

Alternate O4A

Certification by: M,’-—————H
P

lason Lovelace; Senior Project Manager, Balfour Beatty




Parking

03C
B3 Deck Precast

Bids recieved

Apparent low
Bidder

Metromont

Tindall

Base Bid:

$3,002,000.00

$3,120,000.00

Metromont

Alternates:

Alternate 04

$1,465,000.00

$2,130,000.00

Alternate 04A

$80,000.00

$40,000.00

Certification by: %M\

lason Lovelace; Senior Project Manager, Balfour Beatty

BPO4A Masonry

Bids recieved

Apparent low
Bidder

Brodie

Edgar Boettcher

loyner Masonry

Manning Masonry

Contracting Mason Contractor Works
Edgar Boettcher
$885,000.00 $783,800.00 $894,926.00 No bid
Base Bid:
Alternates:
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate 04
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate 04A

Certification by: ,%M

L/

lason Lovelace; Senior Project Manager, Balfour Beatty




Bids recieved

Apparent low

BPOSA :uzt:;al Steel Bidder
CMC Steel Lyndon Steel North State Steel SItet'ell.:ab i i _StEEI of Weldon
Virginia, Inc. Carolina
Lyndon Steel
$1,823,300.00 $1,571,500.00 $1,650,208.00 $1,774,000.00 $2,065,379.00 No bid
Base Bid:
Alternates:
$79,650.00 $115,500.00 $127,129.00 $95,330.00 $190,926.00
Alternate 04
$5,050.00 $5,000.00 $5,210.00 $5,510.00 $4,200.00
Alternate 04A
Certification by: /[
Jason Lovelace; Senior Project Manager, Balfour Beatty
Bids recieved Apparent low
Bidder
BPO6A Carpentry
i i i Hard d
Ste;{ahenson No;:hsﬂ: Clisiva SHEHiGg Chesm:k Cai;lm?ts by Blankeriship ;res\.uicsn
Millwork Millworl corporation esign 18 Northside
Millwork
$197,320.00 $170,782.00 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
Base Bid:
Alternates:
NONE

Certification by: 1%74?/4(&’—7
= </
Jason Lovelace; Senior Project Manager, Balfour Beatty




Bids recieved

Apparent low

Waterproofing Bidder
SR & Caulkin Southern Paint & Strickland
E ABG Caulking Alpha Insulation Martinez : : e a.n Waterproofing
Waterproofing Co. |Waterproofing Co. s
Contractors, Inc. Company Company Specilties, Inc. )
Inc Inc. Waterproofing
. Specialties
$499,500.00 No bid No Bid No bid $986,970.00 $244,892.00
Base Bid:
Alternates:
$80,000.00 $69,672.00 $98,000.00
Alternate 04
$0.00 $4,851.00 $3,000.00
Alternate 04A
Certification by: @7/7‘2%
Jason Lovelace; Senior Project Manager, Balfour Beatty
Bids recieved Apparent low
Bidder
BPO7B Roofing
i i i i Metal fi East
Baker Roofirig Hamlin Roofing BA Rt Martin F'iooflng etal Roofing as err.1
Company Services Corp Corporation
Baker
$375,456.00 $502,313.00 No Bid $760,000.00 No Bid No Bid
Base Bid:
Alternates:
NONE

7

orT

Certification by: %7
- V

Jason Lovelace; Senior Project Manager, Balfour Beatty




BPO8A Metal Wall Panels

Bids recieved

Apparent low
Bidder

. SECO
Advanced Exterior g S Contract, |Bonitz Contracti Metal i
P SEAS Architectural == In?:n = ogcl";p;):vral::cmg SPS Corporation e ac:rnoflng Cofailil?on Steel Clad
Systems ) il i & Metal Roofing
Corporation
$459,100.00 No bid No bid $435,225.00 No bid No Bid $286,000.00 $628,300.00 No bid
Base Bid:
Alternates:
$66,620.00 $67,720.00 $23,000.00 $46,000.00
Alternate 04
7
Certification by: /,Wéé—*—’_“
{,// = [
lason Lovelace; Senior Project Manager, Balfour Beatty
Bids recieved Apparent low
Doors, Frames Bidder
BPO8C
& Hardware Engineerin Martin
Sngeicialtilesg Architectural DH Pace H2H
p Products, Inc. Martin
Architectural
No bid $69,918.00 No bid $118,483.83
Base Bid:
Alternates:
$0.00 $0.00
Alternate 04
$1,412.00 $5,500.00
Alternate 04A

Certification by: %fﬂépfl—\
7 L/

Jason Lovelace; Senior Project Manager, Balfour Beatty




Bids recieved

Apparent low

BPOSE Glass & Glazing Bidder
Brinn Glass Glass Tech SPS Corporation
Glasstech
$1,003,526.00 $960,300.00 $1,254,227.00
Base Bid:
Alternates:
$8,300.00 $35,000.00 $0.00
Alternate 03
$220,600.00 $290,000.00 $261,130.00

Alternate 04

Certification by:

7
i

= il

4
.

Jason Lovelace; Senior Project Manager, Balfour Beatty

Bids recieved

Apparent low

Bidder
BPO9A Drywall
Arn Tecf\ Chavez Interiors | Precision Walls Sears
Construction
Amtech
$545,000.00 no bid $1,049,069.00 no bid
Base Bid:
Alternates:
NONE

Certification by: %7 éW

Jason Lovelace; Senior Project Manager, Balfour Beatty




Bids recieved Apparent low
BPO9B Tile il
" A A of NCINC dba ' ;
David Allen Co., . Tile Setters of ) y Concordia
Inc Diamond Touch Raleigh United Enterprises gaildivia Eominar
) Construction & g TileSetters of
Raleigh
$75,669.00 $94,971.00 $75,200.00 No bid $87,360.00
Base Bid:
Alternates:
(5238.00) $0.00 ($700.00)
Alternate 06

Certification by:

-

Jason Lovelace; Senior Project Manager, %ieatty

Bids recieved

Apparent low

i Bidder
BPO9C ?::I’i‘:t;ca'
& Acousti Bonitz Contracting 5 Paul Barbour & . Southeastern
- . Chavez Interiors Precision Walls e
Engineering Company, Inc. Son, Inc Interiors
Acousti
$281,000.00 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
Base Bid:
Alternates:
NONE

Certification by: %4%
74

Jason Lovelace; Senior Project Manager, Balfour Beatty




Bids recieved

Apparent low

BPO9D Flooring Bidder
Brock Contract David Allen Co., Southeastern Paul Barbour & 5
; ; Bonitz
Services Inc. Interiors Son, Inc
Bonitz
$140,750.00 No bid No bid No bid $129,100.00
Base Bid:
Alternates:
($1,300.00) ($2,146.00)
Alternate 06
Certification by: / - 7 ﬂé,?%-———\
Jason Lovelace; Senior Project Manage%;eatty
Bids recieved Apparent low
Bidder
BPO9E Paint
i T?UCh Oulap Fairh Tri City Services DWH Painting Kenna Pro-Tech
Construction Contracts, Inc
DWH Painting
$139,470.00 No bid $159,350.00 $92,619.00 $150,500.00 No bid
Base Bid:
Alternates:
$23,475.00 $0.00 $7,320.00 $21,100.00
Alternate 04
$6,200.00 $0.00
Alternate 04A

Certification by: %%
o P

Jason Lovelace; Senior Project Manager, Balfour Beatty




Bids recieved

Apparent low

BPO9F Terrazzo Bldder
David Allen Co. ; D i
2 e84 Blair Duron PR DI United Enterprises Bonitz
Inc. Terrazzo, Inc
David Allen
$85,485.00 $159,420.00 No bid No bid $106,146.00
Base Bid:
Alternates:
$20,426.00 $11,070.00 $27,210.00

Alternate 06 s
Certification by: | //\
Jason Lovelace; Senior Project Manage mkatty

Bids recieved Apparent low
BP10A Specialti Bider
S K & R Buildin Engineerin TAAc American Safet
; & ABACO & R & Architectural TCS Cleaning AAC Enterprise H2H ¥
Solutions Specialties Products .
Products, Inc. American Safety
Products
No bid $90,755.00 No bid $93,646.00 $116,012.96 No bid No bid $81,340.00
Base Bid:
Alternates:
$9,320.00 $8,633.00 $0.00 $6,874.00
Alternate 04

Alternate 04A

et

7
Certification by: <
‘_——'7.

(//

lason Lovelace; Senior Project Manager, Balfour Beatty




BP10B Signage

To be bid
at a later date

Bids recieved

Apparent low

BP10C Blinds Bidder
’ : Contract Window Academy - i All About Blinds & | Commonwealth
M tta D AAA Blind Barti
TSRS EC, fgs Treatments Construction A Treibiicd Man Shutters Blinds & Shades
Commonwealth
No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $8,507.00
Base Bid:
Alternates:
NONE
Certification bv%/’ é’%—ﬂ/
Jason Lovelace; Senior Project Manager, Balfour Beatty
Bids recieved Apparent low
Bidder
BP11A Elevators
Kone Schindler Otis Thyssen Krupp
Schindler
No Bid $351,664.00 No Bid $415,496.00
Base Bid:
Alternates:
$20,700.00 $20,000.00
Alternate 04
$127,488.00 $135,000.00
Alternate 04A
7
Certification by; S e

Jason Lovelace; Senior Project Manager, Balfour Beatty




Bids recieved Apparent low
BP15A Plumbing : Bldder
ABL & Associates Tringle Environmental Air
2 SPC Mechanical Mechanical Ivey Brown Brothers
Plumbing, LLC Systems
Contractor, Inc. ABL and
Associates
$575,000.00 $1,142,000.00 No bid No bid No bid $776,300.00
Base Bid:
Alternates:
$31,000.00 $165,000.00 $113,000.00
Alternate 04
$4,500.00 $8,000.00 $5,625.00
Alternate 04A
Certification by: (%
/ L4
Jason Lovelace; Senior Project Manager, Balfour Beatty
Bids recieved Apparent low
: Bidder
BP15B Fire Protection
Allied Fire Strategic First Defense Fire VSC Fire &
Protection, Inc. Connections Protection Security Strategic
Connections
$269,446.00 $194,360.00 No bid $249,400.00
Base Bid:
Alternates:
$26,400.00 $0.00 $3,990.00
Alternate 04
$3,500.00 $33,440.00 $350.00
Alternate 04A

Certification by: /W//Z;VL :
e [+

lason Lovelace; Senior Project Manager, Balfour Beatty




Bids recieved

Apparent low

BP15C Mechanical Bidlosy
ABL & Assaociates Environmental Air
SPCM ical
Plumbing, LLC echanica Ivey Systerns Watco
Watco
$1,889,000.00 $1,717,000.00 No bid $2,269,000.00 $1,611,000.00
Base Bid:
Alternates:
$2,500.00 $9,000.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate 04
$2,500.00 $9,000.00 $6,000.00 $10,726.00
Alternate 04A
Certification by: %%M_\
Jason Lovelace; Senior Project Manager, Balfour Beatty
: . Apparent low
Bids recieved gidder
BP16A Electrical
Bryant Durham LL Vann Electric Moonlite Watson
LL Vann
Base Bid: $1,592,000.00 $1,344,120.00 $1,433,400.00 No bid
Alternates:
Alterrstan] $40,000.00 $52,400.00 $24,400.00
i $65,000.00 $78,500.00 $95,900.00
EtermateaaA $15,000.00 $16,970.00 $21,620.00
Altarrata 0na $18,000.00 $19,500.00 $24,300.00
AieaR $144,000.00 $141,750.00 $240,000.00
Altarnstetii $39,000.00 $16,620.00 $20,000.00
A i ,600.00
Alternate 04B $27,000.00 ;350,00 $5.6

Certification by:

il

7

Jason Lovelace; Senior Project Manager, Balogseattv




